
E9170  

Resurfacing Contract 2015-3, Local Roads (North) 

 
Bids were received for the following vendors: 

 Grand Total          
Baldwin Paving Co., Inc.    $5,929,214.13 
C.W. Matthew Contracting Co.   $5,082,573.40 
Stewart Bros., Inc.     $6,735,946.30     

 
 

W2282  

Mount Calvary Road Water Main Replacement 

 
Bids were received for the following vendors: 

 Total Bid Price    
       

G.S. Construction, Inc.     $718,271.00 
John H. Pruett Construction, Inc.   $919,097.29 
K.M. Davis Contracting Co., Inc.   $953,871.00 
RDJE, Inc.      $1,055,376.00 
Steele & Associates, Inc.    $594,731.00  
Tippins Contracting Co., Inc.    $643,039.00 
Wade Coots Company, Inc.    $694,216.00  

 
 

Sealed Bid # 15-6017 

Nickajack Park Improvements 
 
Bids were received for the following vendors: 
                                                          Base Bid          Alt 1             Alt 2                 Alt 3                    Alt 4  

       
Diversified Const. of GA., Inc.   $1,361,427.00   +$37,157.00     +$14,388.00   +$52,963.00      -$4,590.00 
Ed Castro Landscape    $1,206,000.00   +$52,270.00     +$10,000.00   +$306,900.00    -$8,200.00 
Integrated Const. and Nobility $918,709.09      +$44,958.38     +$23,464.00    +$257,572.99   -$4,000.00 
JHC Corporation    $1,100,000.00   +$18,500.00     +$6,000.00     +$180,000.00     -$1,000.00 
Multiplex, LLC     $986,000.00      +$18,000.00     +$8,000.00     +$250,000.00     -$4,000.00 
Osprey Management    $933,460.00      +$40,000.00     +$19,200.00   +$115,000.00     -$5,600.00 
Reliant Construction, Inc.   $1,080,000.00   +$58,000.00     +$12,000.00   +$168,000.00    -$4,000.00  
Top’s Services, Inc.    $913,000.00      +$51,400.00     +$16,600.00   +$309,600.00     -$7,000.00 
Vertical Earth, Inc.    $912,787.32      +$47,510.94     +$8,910.00     +$214,226.73     -$409.00 



WE Contracting Co., Inc.   $1,249,984.00   +$64,765.00   +$20,700.00   +$335,975.00  -$7,500.00  
Willow Construction, Inc.   $1,053,000.00   +$94,000.00   +$13,000.00   +$288,000.00  -$1,000.00 

 
 

Sealed Bid # 15-6020 

Request for Proposal – Temporary Staffing Services for Cobb County Elections 
 
Bids were received for the following vendors: 
 
Action Staffing of GA., Inc. 
AppleOne Employment Services 
Bara Infoware 
Hands To Lend 
LDMS Staffing 
P.I.E. Management, LLC 
Premier Staffing Source, Inc. 

 
 

Sealed Bid # 15-6021 

Annual Contract - Purchase and Delivery of Caustic Soda 

 
Bids were received for the following vendors: 

25% SOLUTION           
 Per Gallon- Truckload Per Gallon –Less than Truckload          

Allied Universal Corp.  $.695    No Bid 
Brenntag  Mid-South  $.869    $2.12 
Chemrite   $.838    No Bid 
Univar USA, Inc.  $.71    $4.07 
 
 ============================================================= 

50% SOLUTION           
 Per Gallon- Truckload Per Gallon –Less than Truckload          

Allied Universal Corp.  $1.34    No Bid 
Brenntag  Mid-South  $1.479    $3.937 
Chemrite   $1.671    No Bid 
Univar USA, Inc.  $1.59    $3.94

 
 
 



Sealed Bid # 15-6022 

Annual Contract – Vacuum Truck Services 
 
Bids were received for the following vendors: 
 
No Bids Received  

 
 

Sealed Bid # 15-6023 

Purchase of Two (2) FARO Laser Scanner Focus 3D X 330 
 
Bids were received for the following vendors: 
 
       
    Unit 1 Unit Cost Unit 1 Unit Cost      Total Cost of Two Units         
Dustin Forensics         $74,920.00  $76,920.00          $151,840.00  
Earl Dudley, Inc.             $62,875.00  $64,875.00          $127,750.00  
Leica Geosystems, Inc. $46,068.75  $50,993.75          $97,062.50 
 

 
 

 


