Collins, Charlotte

From: Brownlow, Kellie on behalf of Lee, Tim
Sent: Wednesday, October 14, 2015 2:00 PM
To: Collins, Charlotte

Subject: FW: ORR# 15-102 (Cheek 9/24)

From: Tom Cheek [mailto:tomcheek@msn.com]
Sent: Wednesday, September 30, 2015 4:55 AM
To: CobbRecords

Cc: Dance, Deborah; DiMassimo, Faye; Lee, Tim
Subject: Re: ORR# 15-102 (Cheek 9/24)

Yes, this is already public, but is listed as "conceptual only" in both the MOU and Exhibit H of the
Development Agreement, Therefore, it is not a final agreement.

So, let's take a different tact.

I would like to request documentation, and email between anyone at the county and:
The State

The Coliseum Authority

The FTA

The ANLBC

Other county personnel

Media

Private citizen

...where the cost of, and/or scheduling of, the 285 pedestrian/transit bridge is discussed. I believe county
personnel are very aware the the total cost of this bridge, including design, right of way acquisition, landing
areas of both pedestrian and transit components, moving utilities, rebuilding the originating parking deck, etc. is
well over $6-9 million and is probably closer to $20 million, and headed for a final cost near my $30 million
estimate. [ have have studied this in great detail, discussed with experts, and I suspect that the county already
knows, about the real cost, and has known this for months.

The purpose of my request is to find out how long Faye DiMassimo and Tim Lee have known about the real
cost, while continuing to state publicly that the cost is still $6-9 million, therefore, I am copying them on this
request.

Thanks
Sent from my iPad

On Sep 29, 2015, at 5:22 PM, CobbRecords <CobbRecords@cobbcounty.org> wrote:

Mr. Cheek:

Responsive to your request, the Agreement is contained at pages 28-29 of the Development

Agreement. It was also included as Exhibit D to the original MOU. (see attached)
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Thank you,

Linda Knowles

Open Records Duty Officer
Cobb County Attorney's Office
100 Cherokee Street, Suite 350
Marietta, Georgia 30090
(770)528-8082

From: Knowles, Linda On Behalf Of CobbRecords
Sent: Thursday, September 24, 2015 10:54 AM
To: Tom Cheek .

Cc: Dance, Deborah

Subject: RE: ORR# 15-102 (Cheek 9/24)

Mr. Cheek:

This is to acknowledge receipt of your request for records under the Open Records Act. As is our
normal process, we will be conferring with the department(s) with responsibility for records you
have requested and provide a response within three (3) business days.

Thank you,

Linda Knowles

Open Records Duty Officer
Cobb County Attorney's Office
100 Cherokee Street, Suite 350
Marietta, Georgia 30090
(770)528-8082 '

From: Tom Cheek [mailto:tomcheek@msn.com]
Sent: Wednesday, September 23, 2015 10:45 PM
To: Cobb Records

Subject: ORR# 15-102 (Cheek 9/24)

Greetings,

I would like to know if this agreement is completed, and if there are emails or documentation
between representatives of the County and the ANLBC where this agreement is a topic.

Negotiation/Approval/Execution of Transportation and Infrastructure Agreement (Cobb Board of Commissioners to approve)
Thank you,
Tom Cheek

<ORR# 15-102.pdf>
<ORR 15-102.pdf>



